
This appointment is.also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by the, Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ?.(1  Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval orCompetent Authority MR/MS. AKSHAY MUDGAL (Employee ID= 
20181229) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. AKSHAY MUDGAL (Employee ID=20181229) is posted at Nilothi-SBV-1617219 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

(MADAN KUMAR KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-AKSHAY MUDGAL-20181229 9/L/579, INDIRA GANDHI NAGAR, JAGATPURA, JAIPUR, RAJASTHAN 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6CM9 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval Of Competent Authority MR/MS. ALKA (Employee ID= 20181279) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ALKA (Employee ID=20181279) is posted at Mahipal Pur- Amar Shaheed Major Sehrawat SKV-1720032 as 
DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./)MH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/4.q? 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-ALKA -20181279 VILL POST- NAYABAS, TEH-NEEM KA THANA, SIKAR, RAJASTHAN-303105 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

p://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education/Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch/Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ P3L0 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval Of Competent Authority MR/MS. AMAN SINHA (Employee ID= 20181227) 
is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. AMAN SINHA (Employee ID=20181227) is posted at Tekhand - GGSSS-1925027 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ g„,,, 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 
	 §-g'- /g 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-AMAN SINHA-20181227 539,C-POCKET, SARITA VIHAR, SOUTH DELHI 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

:p://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. AMIT KUMAR GUPTA (Employee ID= 
20181262) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall:Stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. AMIT KUMAR GUPTA (Employee ID=20181262Yis posted at Adarsh Nagar, No.1-GBSSS-1309013 as DRAWING 
TEACHER, 

This appointment is temporary and on:provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has, been Medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointmeht is also,subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handida 
certificate by the:Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Edudation. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ e 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned, 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-AMIT KUMAR GUPTA-20181262 86, G.P., JUHI GAUSHALA, HAMIRPUR ROAD, KANPUR NAGAR, UTTAR 
PRADESH-208014 

12. Guard File 

if4Y—CV 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://wwwedudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



This appointment is alsb'subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by dia.,concerried DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. AMRITA SINGH (Employee ID= 
20181245) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under-the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. AMRITA SINGH (Employee ID=20181245) is posted at Mohan Garden-GGSSS -1618264 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./.3MH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11, Employee Concerned-AMRITA SINGH-20181245 VILLAGE CHAUHALDA POST- AGGARWAL MANDI TATIRI, DIST-BAGHPAT, 
U.P.-250601 

12. Guard File 

Pc6/-1" 
(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



This appointment is alSostibject to authentication of documents of clikaMents/certificates including caste and Physical Handida;  
certificate, by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/UniverSities/Authorlties on joining the respective school. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ANKUR KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181226) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poSt of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by hien/her: He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/ 2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ANKUR KUMAR (Employee ID=20181226) is posted at Jahangirpuri, Block D-GBSSS-1309255 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on .'provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 
,!( 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11, Employee Concerned-ANKUR KUMAR-20181226 WZ-22, TATAR PUR, NEW DELHI-110027 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR-GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ARTI SHARMA (Employee ID= 
20181228) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ARTI SHARMA (Employee ID=20181228) is posted at Badarpur Khadar -SV-1104418 aS0121WING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verificetion of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI,HOSPITAL,hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/3MH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is ,also,subject to authentication of, documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by tfie,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universiti4S/ALlthorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of:Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/ReCruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

	 SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order, 
5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education, 

11. Employee Concerned-ARTI SHARMA-20181228 VPO ANTWRA TEH KHATAULI MUZAFFAR NAGAR 

12. Guard File 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (.:)ec 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http:/Iwww.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ARTI TYAGI (Employee ID= 20181290) 
is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING,TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from.time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is.further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ARTI TYAGI (Employee ID=20181290) is posted at Magazine Road-SKV-1207112 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subjectto verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointmept is,a1SOSubject to authentication of 'documents of documents/tertificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the,,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 	 .341  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/14 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. ED Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AA0 Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-ARTI TYAGI-20181290 VILL- FIROZPUR, DISTT- BAGHPAT UP-250101 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education/Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE,4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent;  uthority MR/MS. BHARAT SINGH BAIRWA (Employee 
ID= 20181298) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post.of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. BHARAT SINGH BAIRWA (Employee ID=20181298) is posted at Tughlakabad, Railway Colony, No.2-GBSSS-
1925058 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for tvvo years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She-has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

• 
This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by the,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective schOol. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14/•04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9, HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-BHARAT SINGH BAIRWA-20181298 VILLAGE-BHOLUPURA, POST-MAKANAPUR, TEHSIL-+DISTT- KARAULI, 
RAJASTHAN-322255 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/ 



8/7/2018 
	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

V —  5r-77 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. DEEPAK KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181297) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible wader the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by himiher:'He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. DEEPAK KUMAR (Employee ID=20181297) is posted at Dayalpur-GBSSS-1104010 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hOspital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also:Subject to authentication of:documents of documentS/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/ALithorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of EducatiOn. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-DEEPAK KUMAR-20181297 VILL+POST ABUPUR, NEAR MURADNAGAR, GHAZIABAD, UP-201206 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. DOLLY (Employee ID= 20181272) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from tithe to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. DOLLY (Employee ID=20181272) is posted at Vasant Vihar, C-4,G(Co-ed)MS-1720174 as DRAWING TEACHER. 
• 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 19-04-2018 

This appointment is.alSo•subject to authentication of doCuments of docyrnents/dertificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director ofEdPcation. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Retruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-DOLLY -20181272 159-C, VILL- MOTI BAGH-II, NEAR RAM MANDIR, NANAK PURA, NEW DELHI-110021 

12, Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This appointment' is also subject to authentication of documents ofdocynlents/certificates including caste and Physical Handica 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

• 
This issbes with the concurrence of the Director•of EdUCation, 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

T-/Y 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi SubordlnateServices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent 	MR/MS. FURQAN AHMAD (Employee ID= 
20181288) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall Stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. FURQAN AHMAD (Employee ID=20181288) is posted at New Friends Colony-GBSSS (Chander Shekhar 
Azad)-1925005 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to Verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

g2  -7i 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-FURQAN AHMAD-20181288 NO.7 DANISHMANDAN ROAD NAKHASH, AMROHA UP-244221 

12. Guard File 

Order No: DE,4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ yi 'cc y 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This issues with the concurrence of the Director, of  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

(.) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. GARIMA JAWAL (Employee ID.--
20181277) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible, untlerthe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by.hiM/her; He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/ 2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. GARIMA JAWAL (Employee ID=20181277) is posted at Mukund Pur Village - GGSSS-1207230 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./3MH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also,subject to authentication of documents of dbOments/certificates including caste and Physical HandidaP.i, 
certificatepythe-COncerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. ED Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-GARIMA JAWAL-20181277 B-2/78, 2ND FLOOR, SECTOR-16, ROHINI, DELHI-110089 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This is4ies with the concurrence of the Director ofEdpcation. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (4'1/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of CompetentAuthority MR/MS. HARI KISHAN (Employee ID= 
20181256) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pOst of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by, him/her. 'He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/ 2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. HARI KISHAN (Employee ID=20181.256) is posted at Shahabad Dairy-GBSSS-1310395 as-DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is.aiSsisubject to authenticatioha!documents of dodocuments/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap;  
certificate by fti :.con*:ie'd DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

Endorsement No DE.4(I4)04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 4V( 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1.  P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-HARI KISHAN -20181256 A-65 GALI NO-4 RAJENDRA PARK EXTENTION NANGLOI DELHI-110041 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (SP Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

(I) 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. JITENDRA KUMAR MEENA (Employee 
ID= 20181276) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poSt•Of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shalIStand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. JITENDRA KUMAR MEENA (Employee ID 20181276)is posted at Ranhaula- SBV-1617227 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for twp years and further subject to verifiCation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI,HOSPITALhospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMINI./.1M1-1/1392 DATED 10/04/018  

This appointment is also subject to authenticationrof'doCuments of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the:concern'ed DDE from concerned Institutes/UniversitliS/AUthorities on joining the respective school. 

iv,  
This issued with the concurrence of the Director of EdUcation. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/ReCrUitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ g/ 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order, 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned, 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-JITENDRA KUMAR MEENA-20181276 BEHIND TO SHOP STONE FACTORY MOTI WALI DHANI, DIST- DAUSA, 
RAJASTHAN-303303 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAiriG ARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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3/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate.Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent AuthorIty MR/MS. JYOTI (Employee ID= 20181236) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING:TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She isfUrther directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. JYOTI (Employee ID=20181236) is posted at Bhalswa Village, Sarvodaya Vidyalaya-109280 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointrnetis alsO'Stibject to authentication of documents of dOcuments/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by theiCOncerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Edcication. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EC) Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-JYOTI -20181236 H.NO-95 NEHRU ENCLAVE ALIPUR DELHI-1310031 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

This appointment is.atso;Subject to authentication of documents of documentS/certificates including caste and Physical Handica 
certificate by the-,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universitles/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director ofEducatiOn. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. KISHOR KUMAR MEENA (Employee ID.--
20181278) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poit of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted byhim/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. KISHOR KUMAR MEENA (Employee ID=20181278) is posted at Mustufabad-GBSS-1104014 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for,  two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has beeRmedically examined by the N C JOSH' HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMR/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruttment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-KISHOR KUMAR MEENA-20181278 VPO-GORIR TEH-KHETRI, DIST-JHUNJHUNU, RAJASTHAN-332746 

12. Guard File 

0?,  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

/ 
6 CJ 
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8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordiri,ate-Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. KM SHALU (Employee ID= 20181295) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules.frorn time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. KM SHALU (Employee ID=20181295) is posted at Vijay Enclave-SKV-1821025 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to '.,verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been.rneclically examined by the N C JOSH/ HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./.1MH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also;subject to authenticatiorre documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate certificate by theCpnCerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universitips/AUthorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUM1112 GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

,^) 

g.-11 - 	.e• 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-KM SHALU -20181295 VPO-BARKA, TEH-BARAUT, DIST-BAGHPAT, UP-250611 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMKR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This appointment is alSo*.lbject to authentication of documents of,tIoCuments/certificates including caste and Physical Handica 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director7cif. EduCation. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordlnate'Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of CompetentAuthority MR/MS. KRISHAN KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181243) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her.' He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. KRISHAN KUMAR (Employee ID=20181243) is posted at Narela,Sect. A-6, Pkt-2 -GBSSS-1310430 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 	 1,15 

This appointment is temporary and on, provisional basis fortwo years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. The abo,ve..named

„ 
 candidate has sought exemption from Medical examination by virtue of the candidate 

being in Govt. Service on the basis of documents provided,by the concerned candidate or the candidate's administrative office. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)44/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ' 
-1(tr  el 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-KRISHAN KUMAR -20181243 VILLAGE TURKPUR, P.O. MANDAURA, DISTRICT SONIPAT HARYANA-131103 

12. Guard File 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (04 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Suborcinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent -Authority MR/MS. LALIT MOHAN BHATT (Employee ID= 
20181230) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. LALIT MOHAN BHATT (Employee ID•=20181230) is posted at Sangam Vihar,J-Block - SBV-1923357 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined.by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/3MH/1392 DATED 10,04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents ofdocuments/certificates including caste and Physical Handidaps 
certificate.by the,Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

_ 
This issues with the concurrence of the Director,of Education. 

••• 	• 
Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (47,9_ 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-LALIT MOHAN BHATT-20181230 44-C, KILOKARI VILLAGE MAHARANI BAGH, DELHI-110014 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nicin/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



This issues with the concurrence of the Director ofEducation, 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

—eS7—(S7  
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate'Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of CompetentAuthority MR/MS. MANALI RAWAT (Employee ID= 
20181293) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poSt of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall Stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. MANALI RAWAT (Employee ID=20181293) is poted at Tuglakabad Village-SKV-1925040 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject 	verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is,alsO subject to authentication of documents of documerits/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

(MADAN KUMA(2 GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-MANALI RAWAT-20181293 NAYA GAON, BALBHADRAPUR, KOTDWAR PAURI GARHWAL, UTTARAKHAND- 
246149 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 
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8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ '(l/t( Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

- iC(7-1r 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. MANISH KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181244) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of 'DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by hlritjher. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. MANISH KUMAR (Employee ID=20181244) is poSted at Nithari Village- SBV-1412092 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on 'provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. The above named candidate has sought exemption from medical-examination by virtue of the candidate 
being in Govt. Service on the basis of documents provided by the concerned candidate or the candidate's administrative office. 

This appointment is alSo:Subject to authentication of dOcuments of docurneritS/dertificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by tha:Conei-ne'd DDE from concerned Institutes/UniversitieS/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of,Education. „ 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 
$ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-MANISH KUMAR-20181244 H.NO- B-87, GALI NO-3, NEAR WHITE LEAF PUBLIC SCHOOL, VIJAY NAGAR, 
BAWANA, DELHI-110039 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/ 



This issues with the concurrence of the Director of-Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 
	

Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. MERAJUN NABI (Employee ID= 
20181250) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. MERAJUN NABI (Employee ID=20181250) is posted at Molar Band, No.3- GBSSS-1925399 es DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADIvIN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is.afso,subject to authentication 'ordOcuments of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by theLoncerned DDE from concerned Institutes/UniversitieS/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-MERAJUN NABI-20181250 100 B- WEST OF JAMA MASJID UMARGANJ, BAHERI, BALLIA, UTTAR PRADESH-
277001 

12, Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAti GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent,Authority MR/MS, MUKTA SHARMA (Employee ID= 
20181294) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pqst of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible `under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 17/11/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall'stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. MUKTA SHARMA (Employee ID=20181294) is posted at Mangolpuri, Block Q-SKV-1412080 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

This appointment is temporary and on, provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL'hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN.DMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issue's with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/ReCruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (..) 57) 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-MUKTA SHARMA-20181294 B-7/20, SECTOR-5, ROHINI, DELHI-110085 

12. Guard File 

- /j 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	? 
	 Posting ID: 20180044 

DatT 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. NAND RAM MEENA (Employee ID= 
20181281) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. NAND RAM MEENA (Employee ID=20181281) is posted at Shiv Vihar-GBSSS-1618267 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Copy forwarded to:- 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	
cc. 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-NAND RAM MEENA-20181281 VILL-KHIRKHIDI, POST-MANDERU TEH-TODABHIM DISTT-KARAULI, 
RAJASTHAN-321611 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	
L.) 	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

*f 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. NEERAJ RATHI (Employee ID= 
20181286) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. NEERAJ RATHI (Employee ID=20181286) is posted at Mundka Village-GBSSS-1617018 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMNIJMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ i P. %:' 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-NEERAJ RATHI-20181286 VPO-KHARHAR, TEHSIL- BAHADURGARH, DITRICT-JHAJJAR, HARYANA-124501 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

' ,S, 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. NEHA MARTOLIA (Employee ID= 
20181238) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. NEHA MARTOLIA (Employee ID=20181238) is posted at Tagore Garden, No.2-SKV-1515025 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

fif.c4\;- 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recrultment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-NEHA MARTOLIA-20181238 NEW INDIRA COLONY KHATYARI LOWER MALL ROAD ALMORA UTTARAKHAND 
PIN CODE-263601 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nicin/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/ 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	
f Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. NITIN (Employee ID= 20181271) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. NITIN (Employee ID=20181271) is posted at Uttam Nagar-SBV-1618008 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/7MH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ / 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-NITIN -20181271 A-151 HARI NAGAR CLOCK TOWER NEW DELHI-110064 

12. Guard File 

_ 	A  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education/Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch/ Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	:,P1 
	

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to- the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PARVENDER KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181247) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/ 2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PARVENDER KUMAR (Employee ID=20181247) is posted at Jahangirpuri, Block A- SBV-1309253 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

) 
(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PI 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PARVENDER KUMAR-20181247 NEAR SHIV MANDIR, VILL-KANIYAN, POST AILUM, DISTT-SHAMLI 
(UP)-247771 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GA 

SECTION OFFICER (E 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 /,d(.... 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PHOOL SINGH (Employee ID= 
20181296) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PHOOL SINGH (Employee ID=20181296) is posted at Yamuna Vihar, Block B, No.2-SBV-1104003 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 
	 6 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PHOOL SINGH-20181296 VILL+POST-BIGAHANA, DIST-HAMIRPUR, UP-210507 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV 

http://www.edudeLnic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

" 	51' 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PRACHI BANSAL (Employee ID= 
20181292) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication, 

Mr./Ms. PRACHI BANSAL (Employee ID=20181292) is posted at Pitampura, Block FU-SV-1411008 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

ikqk, 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ y t  7 ( 
Copy forwarded to:- 	 g 
1.. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

!. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

. RD Concerned. 

. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
extificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

E0 Concerned 

AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

)AO Concerned. 

10S concerned. 

Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

Employee Concerned-PRACHI BANSAL-20181292 50, ASHOKA PARK MAIN ROHTAK ROAD, DELHI-110035 

3uard File 

(MADAN KUMAR-6ARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

,dudelmic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	 Posting ID: 2018004 

Date: 18/05/201 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PRADEEP KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181273) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of postin 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PRADEEP KUMAR (Employee ID=20181273) is posted at Azadpur Village-GBSS-1309130 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedent 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARE 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/Pi. 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRADEEP KUMAR-20181273 74 A MADHORI BHAWAN BLOCK-B ROOM NO-19 CHHOTA BAGHARA PRAYAG 
ALLAHABAD, UTTAR PRADESH 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR-GARG 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



FF.  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS, PRADEEP KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181254) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the po4 pf DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs, 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible 'under:the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by tiim/her,'`He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication, 

Mr./Ms. PRADEEP KUMAR (Employee ID=20181254) is,  posted at Najafgarh, No.2-GBSSS-1822009 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two,years and further subject to.;verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL,hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/3MH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by the.Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This is es with the concurrence of the Director of 	ion. 

 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6,'S 

 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/0424cruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 	V.' 
1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRADEEP KUMAR -20181254 H.NO-530, GOPAL NAGAR PH-II GALI NO-04, SURAKHPUR ROAD, 
NAJAFGARH, DELHI-110043 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAFt—GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/ 



Mr./Ms. PRASHANT SINGH (Employee ID=20181287) is,  posted at Mukund Pur Village - GBSS-1207236 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

..i17/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 
Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate.Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PRASHANT SINGH (Employee ID= 

20181287) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poSt,pf DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under 	rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for:two years and furthi ubjgOltoyerification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/Shhas,been medically examined by the N C JOSH,  DSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/AOMN:7.,IMH/1488 DATED 13/04/2018 	A 	111111111. 

t•10.  

' 
This appointmet

40 
 lt:is also subject to authentication of documents of docurn„ehts/certificates including caste and Physical Handida' 

certificat l'ythe;p.5pcerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 
Itdi,,' 	 ., 

This issues with the concurrence of the Di ectoja, EdUcation. 

   

   

  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14
, 
 /00.Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 f3 t."( 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. RS. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

 

 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRASHANT SINGH-20181287 F-25/52, SECTOR-7, ROHINI, DELHI-110085 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR—GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1/1 



This issues with the concurrence of the Director of 

(MADAN KUMiiii GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub r rip 41,tervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
(Z — 

Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent tpority MR/MS, PREETI (Employee ID= 20181258) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWIJNIGJE#CHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rulesfrorn'tirne to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PREETI (Employee ID=20181258) is posted at Nithari-GGSSS-1412131 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

.41. 	:. 	 ,.P' 

This appointment is temporary and on,prOVisional basis for,tWo.years and further subject:to,yerification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has bAervmedically examined by the N C JOSHI 1,-JOSPIT/Wpospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/MH1392 DATED 10-04-2018 	'';.'1 •• 	4,,41, 

This appointment is,a1Spubject to authentication'of doCuments of docurnentS/Oertificates including caste and Physical Handicap;  
certificate by theCencerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universiti sS/AtIthorities on joining the respective school. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04) ethiitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ;, ) 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education, 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PREETI -20181258 VPO-HISHAWADA, DISTT-BAGHPAT, STATE-UTTAR PRADESH-250615 

12. Guard File 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruttment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (••', 

4‘f  

(MADAN KUMAR,GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1 /1 



(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

- 

8;7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

  

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ („ Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

 

  

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate,Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PRIYANKA (Employee ID= 20181255) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rulegro0-,tirrie to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She istfrAfier directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PRIYANKA (Employee ID=20181255) is posted at Azadpur Village-GGSS-1309129 as DRAWING TEACHER. 
• ,„ 

 

aia 

 

This appointment is temporary and onl;FrovAsional basis for,two years and further subjecet&erification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has L*6A,,,g*d ca I I y examined by the N C 7OSHI 	and declared FIT vide their 

O letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMNM04392 DATED 10-04-2018 	 kLug 

eltie 	, 
This appointmeilt isynsO!Subject to authentication.ofidOcuments of documentS/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by th 	once,rned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director off 	ion. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14 	ruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (sc: :3 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. ED Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AA0 Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRIYANKA -20181255 H.NO-18/97 GALI NO-3 EAST MOTI BAGH SARAI ROHILLA DELHI-110007 

12, Guard File 

 

(MADAN KUMAR GARd) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

 

http://www.edudeLnic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



464_ 

(MADAN KUMAR-6A G) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Autnority MR/MS. PRIYANKA JAIN (Employee ID= 
20181291) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible 'under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/he He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PRIYANKA JAIN (Employee ID=201.81291) is posted at Sangam Vihar, J-Block- SKV-1923346 as DRAWING 
TEACHER. 

, 
This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further

• 
 subject to verification of character and antecedents 

• Y 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has, been 'Medically examinediby the N C JOSH!? OSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMP11/3MH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

This appointmetWis also subject to authentication of documents of.,d6Urnehts/certificates including caste and Physical Handi 
certificate by the CQnc'erned DDE from concerned Institutes/UniverSities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Educe ion. 

Copy forwarded to:- 
	

S.- 
1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concemed. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRIYANKA JAIN-20181291 2808, RATAN BHAWAN, MATA WALI GALI, NEAR KINARI BAZAR, CHANDNI 
CHOWK, DELHI-110006 

12, Guard File 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	y. 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04%keCruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/(4'73 77)- 

(MADAN KUMA• G RG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudetnic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



4 

This isses with the concurrence of the Director ofiEdycation. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub9,r 4 	ervIces Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent A4t4or MR/MS. PRIYANKA RANI (Employee ID= 
20181285) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the poSt 9f DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible underthe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by filth/her. He/Sheds further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PRIYANKA RANI (Employee ID•=201 1 8 	sted at Harsh Vihar GGSS-1106256 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and on,provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the N C )OSHI HOSPITALii6spital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN.1JMH/1392 DATED 10/04/2018 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6S:31 

 

This appointme t is 	l ubject to authentication of ddCuments of dqcuments/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by th 	 DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

 

Endorsement No DE.46:4 	bltment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

  

 

r': 

  

4.  4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of Issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9, HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRIYANKA RANI-20181285 A-50/2, STREET NO-3, SUBHASH MOHALLA, NORTH GHONDA, DELHI-110053 

12. Guard File 

 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

 

http://www.edudel.nicin/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



Mr./Ms. RAHUL PANCHAL (Employee ID=20181.268);•is posted at Guru Teg Bahadur Nagar-GB$SS-1309008 as DRAWING 
;p;1, 

TEACHER. 

(MADAN KUMAR ARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordin'ated  ervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. RAHUL PANCHAL (Employee ID= 
20181268) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pogtof DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of. Rs. 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible underthe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her.' He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

This appointment is temporary and wyproViSional basis for:two years and furthersubjeetto,Verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She hasbeen Medically exarnineCLby the N C JOSHI'HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED' 10-04-2018 

40.4j,•:1.1  
This appointrri 	alW%stioject to authentication of documents o 	euments/certificates including caste and Physical Handl& 
certificat 	 9cerned DDE from concerned Institutes/UniVersjtieS/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

4 
oor 	(f4P'' 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of EduCation. 

------ 
(MADAN KUMAR G4RG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-RAHUL PANCHAL -20181268 H.NO-654 CHANDER LOK MAIN 100 FEET ROAD SHAHDARA DELHI-110093 

12. Guard File 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 y 
• 

http.//www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ('t10 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate.Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Compete 	phiti MR/MS. RAMA SHANKAR PANDAY (Employee 
ID= 20181289) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to t 	eDRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible, ug,  

This appointment is temporary and on, proxyisional basis for'two years and further,subjecttpyerification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned, He/Shepas.been'rnedically,,e4q ' d,by the N C JOSH! HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/jMH/1392 DA, 	04-2018 

This appointrnent is also subject to authentication of documents of46CuRcents/certificates including caste and Physical HandicaP,„:;; 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director Of Education. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

s7_ .,s,47 ( Endorsement No DE.4(14 	,,Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (;s/C' 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2, P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned, 

9. HOS concerned, 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11, Employee Concerned-RAMA SHANKAR PANDAY-20181289 VILL- BASMAHUWA, POST SAHSON, DIST ALLAHABAD, U.P.-221507 

12. Guard File 

vcck_i  

(MADAN KUMAR-GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

e rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by hirn/herrt-le/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. RAMA SHANKAR PANDAY (Employee ID 20181289) is posted at New Seelampur, No.2-GBSSS-1105009 as 
DRAWING TEACHER.  
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8'7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ r. yi 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 
n' ,iilla  

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub r• notes'ervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competen 	OpritY MR/MS. RASHMI (Employee ID= 20181270) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWT,0 T 	HER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/- 
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules,lfr'o,ty 	e to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is,furiher 	ected to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand'ancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms, RASHMI (Employee ID=20181270) is poste 	awana, 3.3 Colony- GGMS-1310460 astfiRAWING TEACHER. 

4'0 
This appointment is temporary and oAtovisional basis forAWo years and further subject tQ rifiC.ation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has beet,!,,rpedically examined by the N C JOSHI 1710SFITAL4iospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH/1392 DATED 10-04-2018 

• - 	' 
fit 

This appointment is,,a1 0,,,,Subject to authentication 8f,:decuments of do,cum,entg/crtificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the,ConCerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/

/
Authorities on joining the respective school. 

;0'1a 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director o 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14, 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-RASHMI -20181270 H.NO. 383 BAWANA DELHI-110039 

12. Guard File 

4 Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	• 
• '>,;) it 

fd,\74. \ A 

(MADAN KUMAR-GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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Mr./Ms. REETU KUMARI (Employee ID=20182 ed at West Vinod Nagar-SKV-10020 	RAWING TEACHER. 

ion. 

8/7/2018 
	

Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

rr 	 7 - g --/ g 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subor inatthServices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competep4 9ritV MR/MS. REETU KUMARI (Employee ID= 
20181284) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pA, i'0,dWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 	40 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissibiguEr . die rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted byArt/he?. e/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shatt.Sialid cancelled without any further communication. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	y..  

This appointment is temporary and o 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has bt, 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMIU41-1 

.00 

	

sjonal basis forltV?f,,ears and further subjegi. o 	i ation of character and antecedents 
Clically examined by, the N C JOSHIAIOSpITA ospital and declared FIT vide their 

	

392 DA .ED 0704/2018 	iIiP' v ,1,94  

	

ii.201 	, 

PO' 
This appointm, 	'410 bject to authentication oirtl  cuments of dq 	ent ertificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by fliF 	nc ed DDE from concerned Institutes/Unive 	gthorities on joining the respective school. 

This Ives with the concurrence of the Director of 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
Endorsement No DE.4(41 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned. Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned, 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-REETU KUMARI-20181284 VILL-ROZA JALALPUR, POST-ROZA YAKUBPUR, GREATER NOIDA, UP-201009 
12. Guard File 

tot 

ii 

vruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ‘g,  

(MADAN KUMAR SA-FIG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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This appointment is temporary and o, 	ovAional . basis forigvears and further subje 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has by ROdically examir*klii,x, the N C Jcism,piose 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/AMW 341/1392 DATEpr .0,0442B18 	0 	' 

0? 

Mr./Ms. RISHIKESH MEENA (Employee ID= 81 	posted at Qadipur-GBSSS-1309264 a 	ING TEACHER. 

i iation of character and antecedents 
bspital and declared FIT vide their 

This appointmgg is0 gabject to authentication 'o d cuments of dwentaertificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by €h 	nc ped DDE from concerned Institutes/Univecikl* 4thorities on joining the respective school. 

Vieil 

This is,wes with the concurrence of the Director ofiig 	ion. 

(MADAN KU AR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 
	

Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 
Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subor 	ervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Compete94 	MR/MS. RISHIKESH MEENA (Employee ID= 
20181280) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pOf MI WING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissibtu. ,Ohe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted bydlirp he . e/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shb144dild cancelled without any further communication. 

Endorsement No DE.4( 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-RISHIKESH MEENA-20181280 VILLAGE-KARELA (NR. GOVT PRIMARY SCHOOL) PO-DHAMUN KHURD, DIST- 
SAWAI MADHOPUR, RAJASTHAN-322001 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMA1GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ C1 
T~j 

 

itment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ t 
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4 ecrbitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG: 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV 

8'7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

is 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (/ 
8 

 if I/ 	
iNth.. ,,,,,, 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

1:..i+, 	 T "- <Fly 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subor nate$ervices Selection Board for recruitment to tree 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent4thoritY MR/MS. SABA RAFT (Employee ID --,  20181251) 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWING,r,TgA,CHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/- 
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules,frorn2tiMe to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in .. 	., 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is -further 'directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms, SABA RAFI (Employee ID=201812514 is poStedtat East of Kailash, No.2-SKV-1924027 as DRAWING TEACHER. 
.14.(AV  

.e,,,",4h  

1 . • 	I basisf 	t 
 

This appointment is temporary and on,P ovpiona 	or, woyears and further subject:toL'yerification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has been,Oe'dically examined by the N C JOSHI.HOSPItAl4lospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/JMH B92 DATED 10r04 .-401 .8 "Xi . 	 tv 	,,, ,,,....,,,. ,v- 

This appointm,  
certificate by RI 

410 subject to authentication ofddeuments of documents/Certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
nderned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of,Education. 

(MADAN KUMAtt GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14, 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned, 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SABA RAFI-20181251 NO.7 DANISHMANDAN ROAD NAKHASA AMROHA UTTAR PRADESH-244221 

12. Guard File 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm  



with the concurrence of the Director of,,, oiuca on 

i/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

(47  gi—/g 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate: Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent„AUthorItY'MR/MS. SACHIN SAINI (Employee ID= 
20181261) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pit pf DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible:undepThe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by filM/he l He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 10/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SACHIN SAINI (Employee ID=20181261) is posted at Burari-SBV-1207009 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and or} prov,isional basis for.two years and further subject to; verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has beempedically examined by the N C JOSH' HOSPITAL hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMNOMii/i392 DATED 10-04-2018 Jai  

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 2 

 

This appointor w0 isigliOjLubject to authentication 'of. 	of dgcuments/Certificates including caste and Physical Handicap, 
certificate by t , 	nitfed DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/AUthorities on joining the respective school. 

 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. RS. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

   

 

/; 

  

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. ED Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SACHIN SAINI-20181261. D-833 GALT NO-20 BHMAN PURA DELHI-110053 

12. Guard File 

 

(MADAN fUiviAll. GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 
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8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. SACHIN KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181252) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post  pf DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible„underithe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by hirn/herjHe/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall-stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SACHIN KUMAR (Employee ID=2018125Z) is posted at Mangolpuri, Block K-SBV-1412002 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

....':: 	'.* 

This appointment is temporary and oriikrOV,isional basis fortWO years and further subject'tO;Ye'rifie'ation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has b %medically exam nectby the N C JOSHI HOSPITALJ'iospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADM 	492 DATE 	-q44,31, A 	= 	

, 	 . 

,, +lip'
8  

li 

This appointment is;  lso subject to authentication of-documents of dqcumentS/Certificates including caste and Physical Handicap,  
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Univeplties/ Othorities on joining the respective school. ,  

i•u4 , • 	̂•-• 

This is vies with the concurrence of the Director of 	on. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 g 

Endorsement No DE 4(1'4 / 

Copy forwarded to:- 

/ RecrUitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6  s  6  

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EC Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SACHIN KUMAR -20181252 RZ 46-A STREET NO-3 MAIN SAGARPUR NEW DELHI-110046 

12. Guard File 

kgk r- 
(MADAN KUNTATITGARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.educlehnic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm 	 1 



Mr./Ms. SATYENDRA KUMAR (Employee ID— js posted at Sunder Nagari- GBSSS-1106279 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointor 
certificate by 41 	neciroed DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

fq 

This ist es with the concurrence of the Director of,EduCetion. 

ism )'upject to authenticatiofr,of,ddeuments of dgcpment/certificates Including caste and Physical Handic 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

(MADAN KUMAR- 	6) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ‘Sti Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordthate:1Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent'AutnoritY MR/MS. SATYENDRA KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181260) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the po,k of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible underthe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/hel';'He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

This appointment is temporary and o 	o sional basis fortvvo years and further subject-ft° vetification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has b eh medica ly examined by the N C JOSHI HOSPITAL„hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADM 	Mi-/1'392 DATED,10-04-2018 

Endorsement No DE.4( 	krultment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of Issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. MO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SATYENDRA KUMAR-20181260 VILL AND POST KHALIS PUR BHATAULI PS MALIPUR DISST AMBEDAKAR 
NAGAR UTTAR PRADESH-224159 

12. Guard File 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1 



This appointment is,Wsgvsupject to authentication-'Of'dOeuments of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicapi  
certificate by the concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director ofiEd c ion. 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

eCrUitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	y 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 6 Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordlnate,services Selection Board for recruitment to the 

Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competept;:Authprity MR/MS. SEEMA KUMARI MEENA (Employee ID= 
20181282) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pRii.eril,3AWING TEACHER In the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissib4un, ;the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by Kini/hei2: e/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shalt stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SEEMA KUMARI MEENA (Employee 1,17=20,181282) is posted at Begampur, GGSSS-1413268 as DRAWING TEACHER. 
4100J,-/ 

two This appointment is temporary and o Iprovisional basis fortwo years and further subject 	of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has b en  medically examined by the N C JOSHI-HOSPITALfiospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADIA 	NB-I/1392 DATED 10%04/2018 	 ,i,:;::,.e. 

e Vel!)/ 
Endorsement No DE.4(14#, 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SEEMA KUMARI MEENA-20181282 VIJAY NAGAR MIRZAPUR GANGAPUR CITY DIST-SAWAI MADHOPUR, 
RAJASTHAN-322214 

12. Guard File 

1 (MADAN KUMAR-  RG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm  



Endorsement No DE.4(11 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

Imtment/Drawing/E-IV/ 2017/ 7"' ?' • 
`( 

(MADAN KUMAR ARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordlnate,Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent. Authority MR/MS. SHREYA SINGH (Employee ID= 
20181248) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the pgit of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under;the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by,him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SHREYA SINGH (Employee ID=20181248)!ls po:sted at Gandhi Nagar, No.2-GGSSS-1003634 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

, 
This appointment is temporary and on,Provisional basis for:two years and further subject:to yerification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has beenpMedically examined by the N C JOSHIHOSPITAMOspital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMNVJMH/1392 DATER ),0/04/2018 

•. 
This appointm, 	 bject to authentication'Of ziticuments of documents/Certificates including caste and Physical Handicp 
certificate by th 	ed DDE from concerned Institutes/UniversiqeS/AUthorities on joining the respective school. 

This is Os with the concurrence of the Director of 4i.cnon. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	Lie( 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch, 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SHREYA SINGH-20181248 S4/57, TAWUR, ORDERLY BAZAR, VARANASI, U.P.-221002 

12. Guard File 

fiqb 
(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



Mr./Ms. SHRUTI ROHTAGI (Employee ID=2 

This is e with the concurrence of the Director of. 

,00 
roP'' 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education/Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch/Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Posting ID:, 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 
r - - k - /,'.' 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub9ra14,ei ervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Compete g•'44 9ritii MR/MS. SHRUTI ROHTAGI (Employee ID= 
20181259) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the p0 tp441AVVING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300- 
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissi,u 	tithe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted byj)   rn .he . IL/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 

, 
I..  

latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shai stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

bsted at Chirag Delhi-SKV-1923037 	WING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and 90 monal basis for, wears and further sublet Ito; 	ifi ation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has 	edically examin#* the N C JOSHLitiOSP#AL ospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No, NO.F.1(1)/09/ADIVI, 	/ 392 DATE:14 - *2018 	Sr 1. 

00;•" 
This appointm t isfoUbject to authenticatio 	Ocuments of dg.wrn.en 	rtificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by 	mulled DDE from concerned Institutes/Univelflp tIthoritles on joining the respective school. 

(MADAN KU R RG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Copy forwarded to:- 

Endorsement No DE.4( 4 	''erkiitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ LiD 	

S 
1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SHRUTI ROHTAGI-20181259 1-205/4 GEETA ASHRAM, SADAR BAZAR, DELHI-110010 

12. Guard File 

V4?Yl_ 

(MADAN KUMA—FIGARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

yon. 

http://www.edudel.nicin/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/' 



SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

8/7/2018 
	

Directorate of Education 

t 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 
(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 
Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ \-1 2_57 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Compet9i  
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DFtAWI 
Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rulesdro 
he offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is,10flier ected to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
)4/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stands' blied without any further communication. 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

ervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
rlt, MR/MS. SUMIT (Employee ID= 20181257) is 
ER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-

e to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 

pste Mr./Ms. SUMIT (Employee ID=20181257) is ari Village- GBSS-1412259 as DRA 	TEACHER. 

o go nal basis for 
;xidically examin 

2 DATE 

This appointment is temporary and orb 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has 1115 

M letter No. NO.1(1)/09/ADMMI-1` 

Al  4 11  
4/1: 

years and further subje°1 	ation of character and antecedents 
Attie N C JOSHPIOSTALWospital and declared FIT vide their 

'' 	410." 
4.‘ 

This appointm9 
certificate by th 

is ligobJect to authentication.° ocuments of d u ,en 1 ertificates including caste and Physical Handic 
nceVeti DDE from concerned Institutes/Univ%1 t 	'Oh o ri tl es on joining the respective school. 

This i 
	

es with the concurrence of the Director of.  

(MADAN KUMAR G'ARG) 

Endorsement No DE.4(t 	rthtment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ ( ` gs  
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 
5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SUMIT -20181257 VPO- SUNDANA, DISTT- ROHTAK, STATE-HARYANA PIN CODE-124412 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	c15 

iP 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 
Y7 2 

object to authentication 	
r
ocuments of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handic 

led DDE from concerned Institutes/UniversIti65/AUthorities on joining the respective school. 

This isveS with the concurrence of the Director of+Education. 

This appointm 
certificate by 

Endorsement No DE.4( 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Suhord npte, Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent.Authgrity'MR/MS. SUSHMA (Employee ID= 20181249) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWINGJEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/- 
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from,, 	to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further dWected to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SUSHMA (Employee ID=20181249) is posted at Rajapur Khurd-G(Co-ed)SS-1618192 as DRAWING TEACHER, 
4' ' ' 	',-.0i2-.  

' This appointment is temporary and 0%1? 	tonal basis for,tWo•years and further subjec,`,tg,llr  ye'''rfic'ation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has biij.0 edically examined by the N C JOSH 	OS 	ospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADM ..1MH/ 392 DATEP.1,0/04/2018 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

(7S 

rtaitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (-1325:42 
(1:1 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SUSHMA -20181249 RZ-150B, ROSHAN GARDEN, NEAR NAAM DEV MANDIR, NAJAFGARH, NEW DELHI-
110043 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudeLnic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm 	 1/1 



(MADAN KUMAR`GARI 

SECTION OFFICER (E-I 

8/7/2018 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education/ Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch/ Old Sectt.Delhi.  

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ Clic? Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 

Consequent 

- 
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subord 	. Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent Auth,orit MR/MS. SWATI GUPTA (Employee ID= 
20181246) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the p9st of DRAWING TEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissibtle .undenthe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by.Kim/herHe/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shbll stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SWATI GUPTA (Employee ID=20181246) is posted at Shivpuri-G(Co-ed)SSS-1003205 as DRAWING TEACHER. 

This appointment is temporary and o foVisional basis for two, years and further subject:to,,Verification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has13Miknedically examined by the N CJOSHki,,,HOSPITAV ospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADM 	MM, 1.392 DATED'I0/04/2018  

This appointment isillsubject to authentication of documents of documen slertificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by the conce(ned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of,Cation. 

(MADAN KU-MA R GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4( 4 	t  6^Uitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ (.153 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. RS. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PF 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AA0 Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SWATI GUPTA-20181246 H.NO-41, SECTOR-3, VIDYADHAR NAGAR, JAIPUR, RAJASTHAN-302039 

12, Guard File 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  



Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 	f)-1,/ 

(MADAN -KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

/J 

'7/2018 
	 Directorate of Education 

Posting ID: 20180044 

Date: 18/05/2018 
— 	/ 

e,  1 (-) 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competep(AUtnority MR/MS. UDAY SINGH THAPA (Employee ID= 
20181283) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post DRAWING TEACHER In the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissibje'Underithe rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by film/heHe/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting 
latest by 04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication, 

Mr./Ms. UDAY SINGH THAPA (Employee ID7120181283))S posted at Madanpur Khadar Extn.34,COlohy GBSSS-1925339 as 
DRAWING TEACHER. 

0 	
,.: 

This appointment is temporary and okprpy) ional basis for 	years and further,5ubject toN.i,erification of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/Shefias.been't'rnedically„94MA  LI cd15 ae N C JOSHI/HOSPITAlf hospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No. NO.F.1(1)/09/ADMN./JMH/1392 DATED1.10/04/2018 	 '' 

This appointor' 	also;sdbject to authentication of documents o 
certificateb. tfiej qncerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Univ il  

'lA; 

meats/certificates including caste and Physical Handidt 
egAuthorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the D ect ibf Education. 

1(.1  

;W04 

Endorsement No DE.4(14 /04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ i y-y 
Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned, 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-UDAY SINGH THAPA-20181283 118-C, 2ND FLOOR, POCKET-11, DDA FLATS, JASOLA, DELHI-110025 

12. Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/DirectorateOfEducation.htm  



on. 

8/7/2018 	 Directorate of Education 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-IV Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.4(14)/04/Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ L( 0-r- 	 Posting ID: 20180044 

	

r{ 	ar1Y Date: 18/05/2018 

g2-1:15  
Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Sub?r noeervices Selection Board for recruitment to the 
Post of DRAWING TEACHER and with the prior approval of Competent*poritY MR/MS. VIDHI (Employee ID= 20181253) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of DRAWINGJEACHER in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-
(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rulesf,roSirne to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is fOrther difected to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
04/07/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand 	without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. VIDHI (Employee ID=20181253) is ada(Ghevra) Colony H-Block- SV-1413267 as. DRAWING TEACHER. 

Z!; 
This appointment is temporary and otyprovisional basis for,twto years and further subje 	!lift ation of character and antecedents 
by the DDE concerned. He/She has lven.pedically examined by, the N C JOSHI HOSF ,AL ospital and declared FIT vide their 
letter No, NO.1(1)/09/ADMN/:1MHY4392 DATED401,94L2018 

pail 	ii lii •N 

This appointm 	is jl bject to authentication'ofddcuments of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handic 
certificate by 0-1 	 d DDE from concerned Institutes/Unive,rsitieS/ALithorities on joining the respective school. 

This ist es with the concurrence of the Director of 

(MADAN KUMAR GARG) 

SECTION OFFICER (E-IV) 

Endorsement No DE.4(14)10 Recruitment/Drawing/E-IV/2017/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the SC/ST/PH 
Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AA0 Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned, 

9, HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-VIDHI -20181253 VPO JONMANA BARAUT DIST- BAGHPAT, U.P.-250611 

12, Guard File 

(MADAN KUMAR GAR( 

SECTION OFFICER (E-I` 

http://www.edudel.nic.in/Directorate0fEducation.htm  
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